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Key:

Site Boundary

Approved Planning 
outline 2008

Existing Structure

New structure

DemolitionExisting Outline

000 -

Proposed Ground Floor

- 30.01.23  Issue to Camden Council 

Line of Approved 2008 application 
2007/6360/P

Line of Approved 2008 application 
2007/6360/P

Line of existing building 

Line of existing building 

Line of existing building / internal car 
garage space.

Proposed new single storey extension 

Proposed new single storey extension 

Sliding doors to rear garden

Sliding doors to rear garden

Existing section demolished and rebuilt 
to be in keeping with proposed scheme 
design. 

Proposed front elevation, set back from 
main original house. Bay window is 
proposed, rather than large garage door, 
more in keeping with the house front 
facade architecture and Conservation 
Area. 

Paved area stone

Paved area in stone

Paved area in stone to match existing 

Existing raised stone paved area

New paved driveway in granit or 
similar, pattern and colour to be agreed

Relocation of garage to below ground 
space.  Car lift in finished paving in 
granit or similar, pattern and colour to be 
agreed
No increase in parking provision, only 
relocation. 

New proposed entrance portico in stone 
same as facade details. 

New wall lower than the existing party 
wall. 

Skylight as approved in planning ref. 
2021/4432/P

Skylight as approved in planning ref. 
2021/4432/P

Off-street bin storage area, whithin 
timber teak structure to minimse visual 
impact in Conservation Area as well as 
screening with plants is proposed.

Line of existing party wall and existing 
timber fence above party wall between 
no.4 and no.2 Wadham Gardens. 


