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        22 Heath Drive NW3 7SD
Feature wall and Bench: Front View

Notes:
Do not scale from this drawing.
Check all measurements on site.

Report all errors or omissions
to the designer immediately.

Design notes:

This drawing shows the top and 
front view of the bench, feature wall, 
planters and the fence behind.

As can be seen the standard 1.8 
fence runs behind the whole 
structure and continues around the 
whole garden. At this section 
though, from where the fence 
emerges from the side of the house, 
through to where the fence 
disappears behind the gym, the 
fence is clad in Western Red 
Cedar/Iroko horizontal trellis. 

Planting, including small trees in 
both planters on each side of the 
bench softens the appearance of 
the wall and at night these will be 
up-it to create an attractive effect. 
There will be an LED strip light 
under the lip of the bench 
highlighting this and other small 
uplighters up the wall to create an 
attractive glow of light to the area. 
The sculpture will be mounted in the 
centre of the wall with its bottom 
edge at about 1300mm to ensure 
that it is clear of peoples heads 
when sitting on the bench. 
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