
1 Bedford Square - Basement Door Schedule

DOOR SCHEDULE - MEWSRev B
BEDFORD SQUARE MEWS, LONDON refer to key plan drawings (32)AP021-23_M & 25_M

DOOR 
NO.

ROOM TYPE LEAF SIZE 
w x h

STRUCTURAL 
OPENING w x h

LEAF 
THICKNESS

FIRE 
RATING

GLAZING FINISH ARCHITRAVES HARDWARE ACOUSTIC TREATMENTS NOTES

DB-30 STAIR CPB

New single timber 
casement to match 

existing door. 4 
panel.

824 x 947 910 x 990 40 FD30 N/A Painted

STRADA London Set 2 - 3no. 
hinges, 1no. mortice latch, 1no. 
Lever on rosette, 1no. floor 
mounted doorstop.

To have rebated acoustic threshold 
drop-seals to doors; and rebated 
perimeter seals inside door frames.  
Where visible colour to match door 
frame paint finish as closely as 
possible.

DB-31 SERVICE RISER 
ACCESS

New double timber 
casement to match 

existing doors. 4 
panel.

598 x 2.057 1285 x 2,100 40 FD30 N/A Painted

STRADA London Set 2 - 3no. 
hinges, 1no. mortice latch, 1no. 
Lever on rosette, 1no. floor 
mounted doorstop.

To have rebated acoustic threshold 
drop-seals to doors; and rebated 
perimeter seals inside door frames.  
Where visible colour to match door 
frame paint finish as closely as 
possible.

DB-32 SERVICE RISER 
ACCESS

New single timber 
casement to match 

existing door. 4 
panel.

900 x 2,057 986 x 2,100 40 FD30 N/A Painted

STRADA London Set 2 - 3no. 
hinges, 1no. mortice latch, 1no. 
Lever on rosette, 1no. floor 
mounted doorstop.

To have rebated acoustic threshold 
drop-seals to doors; and rebated 
perimeter seals inside door frames.  
Where visible colour to match door 
frame paint finish as closely as 
possible.

DB-33 SERVICE RISER 
ACCESS

New single timber 
casement to match 

existing door. 4 
panel.

587 x 1,874 593 x 1,880 40 FD30 N/A Painted

STRADA London Set 2 - 3no. 
hinges, 1no. mortice latch, 1no. 
Lever on rosette, 1no. floor 
mounted doorstop.

To have rebated acoustic threshold 
drop-seals to doors; and rebated 
perimeter seals inside door frames.  
Where visible colour to match door 
frame paint finish as closely as 
possible.
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2 Bedford Square - Ground Door Schedule 

DOOR SCHEDULE MEWS
BEDFORD SQUARE, LONDON refer to key plan drawings (32)AP021-23_M & 25_M

DOO
R NO.

ROOM TYPE LEAF SIZE 
w x h

STRUCTURAL 
OPENING w x h

LEAF 
THICKNESS

FIRE 
RATING

GLAZING FINISH ARCHITRAVES HARDWARE ACOUSTIC TREATMENTS NOTES

D0-16 RISER
New double timber 
casement to match 

existing doors. 4 panel.
445 x 2.057 979 x 2,100 40 FD30 N/A Painted

STRADA London Set 2 - 3no. 
hinges, 1no. mortice latch, 1no. 
Lever on rosette, 1no. floor 
mounted doorstop.

To have rebated acoustic threshold 
drop-seals to doors; and rebated 
perimeter seals inside door frames.  
Where visible colour to match door 
frame paint finish as closely as 
possible.

D0-17 RISER Access Panel N/A TBC N/A FD30 N/A Painted N/A N/A

Job No. Project

Document No.

Date

GROUND FLOOR 

Purpose Of Issue (For 
Comment, for Tender, 

For Construction)
FOR LBC APPLICATION

42 BEDFORD SQUARE, LONDON

DOOR SCHEDULE MEWS

P2005698

Refer to drawing 
16028_AS_0_51_

01_C Ground 
Floor Mews Hall 

Elevations.

OCTOBER 2018


	1509_SC_600_BASEMENT
	1509_SC_601_GROUND

