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All dimensions to be checked on site.
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Condenser units to maintain min. 1000mm clear area
to rear acoustic panel to allow for appropriate air
circulation.

Existing cycle Sheffield hoop relocated to make way
for acoustic enclosure. Location TBC.

Break through external wall at approx. 1000mm
(Contractor to confirm on site) above external floor
level into G13, vertical pipe work to be properly
cloaked and sealed at wall, weatherproofing detail to
be agreed on site. Penetration internally to align with
void between suspended ceiling and soffit.

Pipework to run under pavers and beyond ACO drain.

2 no. DMOUHM32, 1 no. DMOUCD021 to be installed
on big foot support frames.

P1    OW  RB    21/05/2024      PLANNING ISSUE

DRAWING FOR PLANNING PLANNING PURPOSES
ONLY. NOT INTENDED FOR CONSTRUCTION.

Existing access to courtyard from Eastern access.

Existing boundary/ perimeter wall.

Refrigerant routed via GC02 into service riser GR.04
before dropping to lower level. For setting out refer to
M&E engineer's design.

2 no. 10 litre dosing pots installed onto rear panel.

Proposed acoustic panels fixed adjacent to
condensing units to east and north, fixings tbc by
contractor. Acoustic panel to be min. 50mm mineral
fibre with perforated metal facing sheet. Acoustic
panels and lid supported by frame, frame to be
mounted on Big Foot system. Frame tbc by specialist
contractor.

Proposed acoustic lid to plant area as per specialist
design. Lid to extend min. 300mm beyond plant
machinery in all directions.

P2    RB   RB    04/07/2024      Acoustic lid and panels adjacent to neighbouring wall added.
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