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Demolish basement partitions 
and toilets 

Remove staircase handrail, 
glazing, and door to lobby
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Demolish conservatory

Remove wall and piers 
separating conservatory from 
rear of building at ground floor 
level

Remove skylight above
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Remove windows, lower cill 
height

Demolish conservatory

Remove skylight above, open up 
roof  for new skylight

Remove skylight and windows 
surrounding lightwell

Enlarge window opening
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Remove skylight, open up roof 
for new skylight
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Section CC Section DD

Demolish conservatory

Remove windows, lower cill 
heights

Remove basement partitions and 
toilets 

Remove wall and piers 
separating conservatory from 

rear of building at ground floor 
level

Remove cornices and skirtings in 
post-war extension 

Open up roof for new skylight

Replace skylight

Replace windows to lightwell
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Section FF
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Replace windows

Remove skylight , open up roof 
for new skylight

Remove cornices and skirtings in 
post-war extension

Demolish conservatory

Lower floor level under conservatory 

Remove wall and piers 
separating conservatory from 
rear of building

Remove modern glazing

Remove modern glazing and door

Replace skylight and windows to lightwell 
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Demolish conservatory

Remove skylight, open up roof 
for new skylight

Remove windows, lower cill heights

Remove cornices and skirtings in 
post-war extension

Remove basement partitions and toilets

Remove wall and piers 
separating conservatory from 
rear of building

Lower floor level under conservatory 
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